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Mindcrest wins India Business Law Journal LPO awards in 3 categories – Best overall LPOs, Legal 
Support and Corporate Services. 
 
Jan 2012 – Chicago –Mindcrest, a pioneer and leader in legal services outsourcing, announced today that it has 
received India Business Law Journal’s LPO awards in three categories – Best overall LPOs, Legal Support and 
Corporate Services.  This award is in recognition of Mindcrest’s accomplishments in providing innovative products 
and services, increased value to customers, operational excellence and growth.  
 
“Mindcrest has consistently received praise from its clients and industry peers during the three years that India 
Business Law Journal has presented its annual LPO awards. It gives us great pleasure to recognize this 
outstanding achievement by awarding Mindcrest with a Best Overall LPO award and awards for Corporate 
Services and Legal Support”, said James Burden, Publisher of India Business Law Journal. 
 
“We have a reputation for providing highest quality work and exceptional client service and are known for our 
commitment to excellence and for our ability to find innovative solutions. We are pleased that India Business Law 
Journal has recognized us as the Best Overall LPO for the third successive year,” said Ganesh Natarajan, 
Mindcrest’s President and CEO. 

India Business Law Journal's annual LPO Awards are based on an extensive survey of in-house counsel at major 
international corporations and partners at regional and international law firms. In determining the winners for each 
category, the survey results were considered carefully by India Business Law Journal's editorial team in along 
with other factors such as client references and notable achievements for each LPO over the past year.  

“Mindcrest brings specific strengths and abilities that set it apart from other LPO service providers. We have an 
experienced team and strong operational processes to ensure that the work will be performed consistently and 
will be of the highest quality resulting in trusted long term relationships with our clients. In 2011, we have entered 
new industry segments as well as expanded our core service offerings.  The projects that we handle for our 
clients are more complex and complicated than those of our competitors, and we have continued to grow and 
evolve faster than any other player in this industry space” Ganesh Natarajan added.   
 
About Mindcrest  
 
Since 2001, Mindcrest has been a trusted partner to law firms and in-house counsel in delivering a suite of legal 
process outsourcing services in the areas of litigation, corporate legal services and legal content and 
publishing.  Our services and operations are underpinned by an experienced workforce of attorneys, supported by 
a disciplined approach to execution and delivery.  
 
Mindcrest has been consistently recognized as a leader in legal process outsourcing by Frost and Sullivan, The 
Black Book of Outsourcing, International Association for Outsourcing Professionals and India Business Law 
Journal. 
 
For more information, please visit www.mindcrest.com or call +312 467 9744. 
 
About India Business Law Journal 
 
Published 10 times per year, India Business Law Journal provides in-depth coverage and critical analysis of the 
legal, financial and  regulatory issues. Since its launch in 2007, has become an indispensable resource to many 
of the world’s leading  corporations, financial institutions, law firms and universities. Their unique coverage 
provides practical advice on key business law issues such as  regulatory compliance, IP protection, taxation, 
dispute resolution, competition  law and much more.  
 
For more information, please visit www.indilaw.com 
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